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Recommendations for noting: 
 
The Health and Wellbeing Board is asked to note the progress of the Adult Delivery Board’s 
work plan for 2013/14, in particular: 
 

I. The progress being made in co-producing key partnership strategies which look to 
address strategic issues such as Urgent and Emergency Care, Long Term Conditions, 
Reablement and Dementia which cut across partner organisations; and 
 

II. The engagement of providers and key stakeholders from across the city in developing 
these strategies ensuring they are reflective of the needs of its service users. 

 
 
1.0 Purpose 
 
1.1 To keep members of the Health and Well Being Board informed of the work of the Adult 

Delivery Board in regard to the Board’s work plan for 2013/14. 
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2.0 Background 
 
2.1 The Board received updates in relation to the work being progressed around the 

development of the following strategies: 
 

 Urgent Care 
 Long Term Conditions 
 Reablement 

 
as well as, considering the Mental Health and Psychological Well Being Strategy 
Implementation Plan; discussing the development of the Board’s performance 
management framework; and receiving an update on the outcome of Wolverhampton’s 
Integration Pioneer expression of interest. 

 
3.0 Progress 
 
3.1 The Draft Urgent and Emergency Care Strategy was considered by the Board before its 

final presentation to the HWBB on the 6th November 2013.  The Board agreed there was 
more work to be done to include reference to social care and the needs of children.  The 
next iteration of the draft strategy would look to incorporate both of these areas in more 
detail. 

 
3.2 The Board received an update on the development of the Long Term Condition Strategy 

which was currently being progressed by Wolverhampton City Clinical Commissioning 
Group (WCCCG) centred on the following key workstreams: 

 Proactive management of long term conditions, 
 Improving delivery of service, and 
 Early diagnosis and lifestyle management. 

 
The first iteration of the draft strategy would be presented to the next meeting of the Adult 
Delivery Board. 

 
3.3 The Board were informed of the progress of the Reablement Forward Plan refresh and 

the proposals surrounding the development of corresponding: 
 Governance Structures, 
 Hierarchy of outcomes and metrics, and 
 Short/medium/long term priorities. 

 
Senior Responsible Officers had now been identified to lead on various aspects of this 
work with a view to presenting the draft Forward Plan to the December Board meeting.  

 
3.4 The Board were presented with an overview of the proposed changes to the National 

Probation Services and the likely impact on future provision of service and continued 
support to Boards at both local and regional level.  With effect from the 1st April 2014, 
Wolverhampton, Dudley and Walsall will form a single senior manager role as part of the 
National Probation Service.  A new Provider will take over the delivery of the service in 
October 2014 following a process of tendering. 
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3.5 The Board received a summary overview of the Mental Health & Psychological Well-

Being Strategy Implementation Plan and the work being undertaken by the Black Country 
Partnership Foundation Trust’s Children and Young Peoples Transformation Team to 
develop the next steps of the plan.  It was reported that a number of key priorities would 
be actioned as part of the next steps which will be coordinated via Task and Finish 
groups. 

 
3.6 The Board noted that whilst the Wolverhampton Integration Pioneer Expression had been 

unsuccessful, the Health and Care economy in Wolverhampton had agreed to keep the 
momentum going in terms of delivering the objectives of the bid.  A 90 day quick wins 
action plan would be presented to the next Board meeting. 

 
3.7 The Board also discussed the development of a performance management framework, 

which would enable them to be kept abreast of any slippage/difficulties in delivering the 
strategic implementation plans and allow for issues to be escalated and managed in a 
controlled environment.  More detailed proposals would be presented to the next Board 
meeting. 

 
4.0 Financial implications 
 
4.1 There are no direct financial implications to this report. 
 

[NM/25102013/S] 
 
5.0 Legal implications 
 
5.1 There are no direct legal implications to this report.  
 

[RB/18102013/A] 
 
6.0 Equalities implications 
 
6.1 There are no direct equalities implications to this report. 
 
7.0 Environmental implications 
 
7.1 There are no direct environmental implications to this report. 
 
8.0 Human resources implications 
 
8.1 There are no direct human resource implications to this report. 
 


